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 CHRISTMAS OPPORTUNITIES FOR SERVICE  

Salvation Army Bell Ringing  

Start off the Christmas season by ringing bells for the Salvation Army on Saturday,  
December 7. We have 2 sites in Exton this year. Boscov’s and Hobby Lobby are avail-
able for 2 hour shifts starting with 10am-12noon and ending with 6pm-8pm.   Share a 
shift with a friend or family member and celebrate the season in this meaningful way.  

For more information or to sign up, contact Sue Thomas at                                                            
missionandoutreach@grovechurch.org or contact the church office. 

 

Christmas Food Appeal  

Grove has a long history of providing food for our neighbors in need at Christmas.  
Through the generous donations from our congregation each year, we are able to pro-
vide $50 grocery gift cards to about 80 families through CYWA, Chester County Chil-
dren, Youth and Family Services as well as families in our community who contact 
Grove for help.  If you’d like to be part of this ministry, you can send a check to the 
office or put it in the offering plate on Sunday now through December 8.  Please put 
Christmas Food Appeal in the memo line. You can also give through the giving link on 
Grove’s website. Choose one, select “other” then put “Christmas Food Appeal” in the 
“fund desired” box.  If you have any questions, please contact Sue Thomas at mis-
sionandoutreach@grovechurch.org or call the church office.  Please help us continue 
this great tradition!  

 

Christmas Gift Appeal  

If you would like to bring the joy of Christmas to a child in need, please consider donat-
ing to this ministry. With the funds collected, we purchase store and VISA gift cards, 
allowing parents to purchase gifts for their family.  These families are identified through 
CYWA, Chester County Children, Youth and Family Services as well as some families 
in our community who have reached out to Grove for assistance. We will be accepting 
donations now through December 8.   You can send a check to the office or put it in the 
offering plate on Sunday.  Please put “Christmas Gift Appeal” in the memo line.  You 
can also give through the giving link on Grove’s website.  Choose “other” and then put 
“Christmas Gift Appeal” in the “fund desired” box.   We have another opportunity in No-
vember through the Prison Ministry of Chester County to provide gifts in the amount of 
$50-$75.  

 If you are interested in this program or have any questions, please contact Richard 
and Joanna Nichols at missionandoutreach@grovechurch.org or call the church office.    



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Visit Churchtrac to see all the activities at Grove and much more.   

Register to see your giving, update your address, phone number and more! 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

            Scan the QR code to register.  



 
 Nurture Happenings 

 

During December the Nurture Team will be visiting and delivering small Christmas gift 
bags to our homebound members. These were assembled in early November and 
contain a cute homemade item as well as a few sweet treats. In addition, the Christ-
mas cards signed back in early November will be mailed shortly as well as cards to 
our college students at their home addresses. In addition, cards carrying our Christ-
mas greetings will be distributed to the 22 members of our Preschool staff.  

 

The next meeting of the Nurture Team will be Sunday, January 12 at 12:45 in Fellow-
ship Hall. We have some exciting initiatives to discuss and invite anyone interested to 
join us. 

 

We’ve noticed…. 

Grovers filled all the slots on Election Day to serve coffee and snacks to voters who 
came to our building. Thank you to all of you who put a face to Grove Church and   
offered hospitality that day! Thanks to Betty Traver for organizing, and helpers Phil 
and Alison Ray, Bob and Carol Moore, Nicole Paul, Jennifer Geyer, Syd Raihall,   
Mary Jane West, Linda Seybold, Penny Arndt, Marshall Mattie, Richard and Joanna 
Nichols, Lilian Rubin, Becky Aaker, Denise Shelton, Chris Yarnall, Nancy Peterka, 
Susan Parno and Kathy Parker.   

 

 

We need your help! Our online worshippers are seeing an empty sanctuary on     
Sunday mornings. When you get to the sanctuary for the 9am service, if you notice 
that the first few rows are empty, would you consider moving up to the front? This 
would offer a more accurate picture of our congregation during the 9:00 worship    
service AND our online worshippers might recognize you and enjoy seeing you!  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Registration is now open for the Pocono Winter Retreat!  This event is perfect for      
singles, couples, and families with children of all ages.  Attendees will enjoy delicious 
meals, snacks, fellowship, games, sledding, hiking, and much more!  Most of the week-
end is unstructured, but there will be a variety of optional scheduled activities.  We had 
35 people last year; our goal for this year is 60.  Please help us get there!   

 

Don't miss out on this wonderful weekend!  Here are some highlights from last year's 
attendees. 

"Sledding!" 

"Playing in the snow" 

"Getting to know my church friends better" 

"Beautiful walks in the snowy woods" 

"Playing card and board games" 

"Relaxing in the peacefulness of this remote place" 

 

Scan the QR code to sign up.  See Glen Lewis if you have any questions. 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 



  

 

 

 

 

 

This year’s Rise Against Hunger event is scheduled at Grove on April 6, 2025.  

 

 

So just what is this Rise Against Hunger event? This is an event at Grove in which   

everyone can participate and we need all your hands on deck. So, add it to your         

calendar now! 

 

For all ages from 6 to 600, there are jobs for everyone, standing or seated. For those 

under 6, we will have babysitting services available.  

 

If you have not joined us before, here‘s what you can expect. In Asbury Hall there are 

multiple stations. The first is the funnels where groups of volunteers pour veggies, pro-

tein, a vitamin pack, and rice through a funnel into a bag held by another volunteer. 

They put the bag into a box, collecting 5-6 bags, and call for a runner (our youth are 

perfect for this job) to carry the open bags to the weighing table. The weighers make 

sure each bag is within a certain weight range and add or remove rice as needed. The 

runners are called again to carry the bags to the sealers with their hot machines to seal 

the bags. Runners then carry the sealed bags to the boxers who pack 36 bags per box, 

seal the boxes, load them on a pallet, then back onto the truck. They are then taken to 

the RAH warehouse where they are joined with other meals and sent overseas to those 

in need. Last year RAH distributed 4.3 total meals . 

 

During Grove’s 2024 RAH event, we packaged 22,000 meals that were sent to hungry 

communities around the world as part of the global movement to end hunger. Funding 

for this event comes from our Oreo sale in January, the Grove budget, and donations 

from members of our congregation. With your participation and support, we hope to 

reach our 2025 goal to package 22,000 meals.  

 

Any questions, please email riseagainsthunger@grovechurch.org. 

mailto:riseagainsthunger@grovechurch.org


 
 



 
 



 
 



 


